
Sent: 12/6/2019 10:58:49 AM

From: Ron Hogan <rhogan@CITYOFMALDEN.ORG
To: "Daniel Grover" 
Cc: 
Bcc: 
Importance: Normal
Subject: RE: Encore Check

Gracias.

From: Daniel Grover <dgrover@CITYOFMALDEN.ORG> 
Sent: Friday, December 6, 2019 10:58 AM
To: Ron Hogan <rhogan@CITYOFMALDEN.ORG>; Jonathan Davis 
<jdavis@CITYOFMALDEN.ORG>; Charles A. Ranaghan <cranaghan@CITYOFMALDEN.ORG>
Subject: RE: Encore Check

I have it in hand right now. I will walk it down to Maria in a few minutes. 

From: Ron Hogan <rhogan@CITYOFMALDEN.ORG> 
Sent: Friday, December 6, 2019 10:58 AM
To: Jonathan Davis <jdavis@CITYOFMALDEN.ORG>; Charles A. Ranaghan 
<cranaghan@CITYOFMALDEN.ORG>; Daniel Grover <dgrover@CITYOFMALDEN.ORG>
Subject: Encore Check

Pls be on the lookout for a 100,000 check from encore, made to Malden Community Fund. It will 
need to go to Maria Luise as it’s a separate entity non profit….pls let me know if you see it.

Thanks
Ron
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